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Students 
Wellness 
 
Preamble 
 
The Governing Board recognizes the link between student health and learning and desires to 
provide a comprehensive program promoting healthy eating and physical activity for district 
students. The Superintendent or designee shall build a coordinated school health system that 
supports and reinforces health literacy through health education, physical education and activity, 
health services, nutrition services, psychological and counseling services, health promotion for 
staff, a safe and healthy school environment, and parent/guardian and community involvement.  
To encourage consistent health messages between the home and school environment, the 
Superintendent or designee may disseminate health information and/or the district's student 
wellness policy to parents/guardians through district or school newsletters, handouts, 
parent/guardian meetings, district and school web sites, and other communications. Outreach to 
parents/guardians shall emphasize the relationship between student health and academic 
performance.  
 
The Board is committed to the optimal development of every student. The District believes that for 
students to have the opportunity to achieve personal, academic, developmental and social 
success, we need to create positive, safe and health-promoting learning environments at every 
level, in every setting, throughout the school year.     
 
This policy outlines the District’s approach to ensuring environments and opportunities for all 
students to practice healthy eating and physical activity behaviors throughout the school day while 
minimizing commercial distractions.   
 
The District will convene a representative district wellness committee that will strive to meet at 
least 2-3 times per year to establish goals for and oversee school health and safety policies and 
programs, including development, implementation and periodic review and update of this district-
level wellness policy (DWP).   
 

The DWC membership will represent all school levels (elementary and secondary schools) and 
include (to the extent possible), but not be limited to: parents and caregivers; students; 
representatives of the school nutrition program (e.g., school nutrition director); physical education 
teachers; health education teachers; school health professionals (e.g., health education teachers, 
school health services staff [e.g., nurses, physicians, dentists, health educators, and other allied 
health personnel who provide school health services], and mental health and social services staff 
[e.g., school counselors, psychologists, social workers, or psychiatrists]; school administrators 
(e.g.., superintendent, principal, vice principal), school board members; health professionals (e.g., 
dietitians, doctors, nurses, dentists); and the general public. To the extent possible, the DWC will 
include representatives from each school building and reflect the diversity of the community.  
 
The DWC will set forth Action Plans which will be a virtual to-do list that guides the committee 
towards achieving the District wellness goals. 

The committee will utilize assessments to review the policy and determine areas of focus on a 
yearly basis. As the committee works toward implementing healthy changes district wide, these 
Action Plans will keep all work saved and updated in real-time so that community members, staff, 
parents and students are always aware of committee progress and have clear next steps. 



Mark West Union School District       Board Policy 5030 
 

Adopted:  06/06/06                                         Page 2 of 8 
Revised:  04/09/19 
Reviewed: 04/09/19 

The Action Plan will help take small achievable steps that contribute to transforming the district 
into a healthier environment. Each action item includes: 

 Implementation strategies to guide your online and offline actions 
 Clear examples of what success looks like 
 A common place to share notes with your team 
 Resources and tools to help effectively achieve your goals 

 
Leadership 
The Superintendent or designee will convene with the District Wellness Committee (DWC) and 
facilitate development of and updates to the wellness policy, and will ensure each school’s 
compliance with the policy. The Designated office for oversight will be a site administration on a 
two-year rotation. (Begin with Patrick Eagle of San Miguel as of 6/6/2017).  
 
Nutrition and Physical Activity Goals  
The Board shall adopt goals for nutrition promotion and education, physical activity, and other 
school-based activities that promote student wellness.  

The district's nutrition education and physical education programs shall be based on research, 
consistent with the expectations established in the state's curriculum frameworks and content 
standards, and designed to build the skills and knowledge that all students need to maintain a 
healthy lifestyle.  

Nutrition education shall be provided as part of the health education program and, as appropriate, 
shall be integrated into other academic subjects in the regular educational program. Nutrition 
education also may be offered through before- and after-school programs.  

All students shall be provided opportunities to be physically active on a regular basis. 
Opportunities for moderate to vigorous physical activity shall be provided through physical 
education and recess and may also be provided through school athletic programs, extracurricular 
programs, before- and after-school programs, programs encouraging students to walk or bicycle to 
and from school, in-class physical activity breaks, and other structured and unstructured activities.  

The Board may enter into a joint use agreement to make district facilities or grounds available for 
recreational or sports activities outside the school day and/or to use community facilities to expand 
students' access to opportunity for physical activity.  

The Superintendent or designee shall encourage staff to serve as positive role models for healthy 
eating and physical fitness. He/she shall promote work-site wellness and may provide 
opportunities for regular physical activity among employees. Professional development may 
include instructional strategies that assess health knowledge and skills and promote healthy 
behaviors.  
 
Nutritional Guidelines for Foods Available at School  
For all foods available on each campus during the school day, the district shall adopt nutritional 
guidelines which are consistent with 42 USC 1773 and 1779 and support the objectives of 
promoting student health and reducing childhood obesity. (42 USC 1758b)  

http://www.gamutonline.net/displayPolicy/191993/5
http://www.gamutonline.net/displayPolicy/191999/5
http://www.gamutonline.net/displayPolicy/685413/5
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The Board believes that foods and beverages available to students at district schools should 
support the health curriculum and promote optimal health, taking into consideration the needs of 
students with special dietary needs. Nutritional standards adopted by the district for all foods and 
beverages sold to students, including foods and beverages provided through the district's food 
service program, shall meet or exceed state and federal nutritional standards.  

In order to maximize the district's ability to provide nutritious meals and snacks, all district schools 
shall participate in available federal school nutrition programs, including the National School Lunch 
and School Breakfast Programs and after-school snack programs, to the extent possible. When 
approved by the California Department of Education, the district may sponsor a summer meal 
program.  

The Superintendent or designee shall encourage school organizations to use healthy food items or 
non-food items for fundraising purposes. He/she also shall encourage school staff to avoid the use 
of non-nutritious foods as a reward for students' academic performance, accomplishments, or 
classroom behavior.  

School staff shall encourage parents/guardians or other volunteers to support the district's nutrition 
education program by considering nutritional quality when selecting any snacks which they may 
donate for occasional class parties. Class parties or celebrations shall be held after the lunch 
period when possible.  
 
Food and Beverage Marketing in Schools 
 
The District is committed to providing a school environment that ensures opportunities for all 
students to practice healthy eating and physical activity behaviors throughout the school day while 
minimizing commercial distractions. The District strives to teach students how to make informed 
choices about nutrition, health and physical activity. These efforts will be weakened if students are 
subjected to advertising on District property that contains messages inconsistent with the health 
information the District is imparting through nutrition education and health promotion efforts. It is 
the intent of the District to protect and promote student’s health by permitting advertising and 
marketing for only those foods and beverages that are permitted to be sold on the school campus, 
consistent with the District’s wellness policy. 
 
Any foods and beverages marketed or promoted to students on the school campus*during the 
school day* will meet or exceed the California Nutrition Standards. 

 

Fundraising 

By being resourceful and creative, you can raise funds for your school while reinforcing the 
lessons you’re teaching students about healthy eating 

To support children’s health and school nutritional-education efforts, sites that support fundraising 
activities will be strongly encouraged to not involve food or will only be encouraged to use the 
foods that meet the above California Nutrition and portion size standards for foods and beverages 
sold individually for consumption. Fundraising promotion and distribution will take place one-half 
hour before and after school.  Schools will encourage fundraising activities that promote physical 
activity as much as possible.  The Wellness Committee will make available a list of ideas for 
acceptable fundraising activities. 
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Implementation, Monitoring, Accountability and Community Engagement 
The District will develop and maintain a plan for implementation to manager and coordinate the 
execution of this wellness policy. The plan delineates roles, responsibilities, actions and timelines 
for each site; and includes information about who will be responsible to make what change, by 
how much, where and when; as well as specific goals and objectives for nutrition standards for all 
foods and beverages available on the school campus, food and beverage marketing, nutrition 
promotion and education, physical activity, physical education and other school-based activities 
that promote student wellness. It is recommended that the school use the Healthy Schools 
Program online tools to complete a school-level assessment based on the Centers for Disease 
Control and Prevention’s School Health Index, create an action plan that fosters implementation 
and generate an annual progress report. 
 
This wellness policy and the progress reports can be found at: www.mwusd.org. 
 
The District will retain records to document compliance with the requirements of the wellness 
policy at 305 Mark West Springs Road, Santa Rosa, CA and/or on www.mwusd.org.  
Documentation maintained in this location will include but will not be limited to:  
 The written wellness policy; 

 Documentation demonstrating that the policy has been made available to the public; 

 Documentation of efforts to review and update the Local Schools Wellness Policy; including an 

indication of who is involved in the update and methods the district uses to make stakeholders 

aware of their ability to participate on the DWC; 

 Documentation to demonstrate compliance with the annual public notification requirements; 

 The most recent assessment on the implementation of the local school wellness policy; 

 Documentation demonstrating the most recent assessment on the implementation of the Local 

School Wellness Policy has been made available to the public. 

Annual Notification of Policy 
 
The District will actively inform families and the public each year of basic information about this 
policy, including its content, any updates to the policy and implementation status. The District will 
make this information available via the district website and/or district-wide communications such 
as First Day of School Packets. The District will provide as much information as possible about the 
school nutrition environment. This will include a summary of the District’s events or activities 
related to wellness policy implementation. Annually, the District will also publicize the name and 
contact information of the District/school official leading and coordinating the committee, as well as 
information on how the public can get involved with the school wellness committee. 
 
Triennial Progress Assessments  
 
At least once every three years, the District will evaluate compliance with the wellness policy to 
assess the implementation of the policy and include: 
 The extent to which schools under the jurisdiction of the District are in compliance with the 

wellness policy; 

 The extent to which the District’s wellness policy compares to the Alliance for a Healthier 

Generation’s model wellness policy; and 

 A description of the progress made in attaining the goals of the District’s wellness policy. 

http://www.schools.healthiergeneration.org/
http://www.schools.healthiergeneration.org/
http://www.mwusd.org/
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The position/person responsible for managing the triennial assessment and contact information is 
the Superintendent or designee. The DWC, in collaboration with individual schools, will monitor 
schools’ compliance with this wellness policy.   
The District will actively notify households/families of the availability of the triennial progress 
report.   
 
Revisions and Updating the Policy 
 
The DWC will update or modify the wellness policy based on the results of the annual School 
Health Index and triennial assessments and/or as District priorities change; community needs 
change; wellness goals are met; new health science, information, and technology emerges; and 
new Federal or state guidance or standards are issued. The wellness policy will be assessed and 
updated as indicated at least every three years, following the triennial assessment. 
 
Notifications, Community Involvement, Outreach and Communications 
 
The District is committed to being responsive to community input, which begins with awareness of 
the wellness policy. The District will actively communicate ways in which representatives of DWC 
and others can participate in the development, implementation and periodic review and update of 
the wellness policy through a variety of means appropriate for that district. The District will also 
inform parents of the improvements that have been made to school meals and compliance with 
school meal standards, availability of child nutrition programs and how to apply, and a description 
of and compliance with California nutrition standards. The District will use electronic mechanisms, 
such as email or displaying notices on the district’s website, as well as non-electronic 
mechanisms, such as newsletters, presentations to parents, or sending information home to 
parents, to ensure that all families are actively notified of the content of, implementation of, and 
updates to the wellness policy, as well as how to get involved and support the policy. The District 
will ensure that communications are culturally and linguistically appropriate to the community, and 
accomplished through means similar to other ways that the district and individual schools are 
communicating important school information with parents.  
The District will actively notify the public about the content of or any updates to the wellness policy 
annually, at a minimum. The District will also use these mechanisms to inform the community 
about the availability of the annual and triennial reports.  
 
Records 
The Superintendent or designee shall retain records that document compliance with 7 CFR 
210.30, including, but not limited to, the written student wellness policy, documentation of the 
triennial assessment of the wellness policy for each school site, and documentation demonstrating 
compliance with the community involvement requirements, including requirements to make the 
policy and assessment results available to the public.  
 
Posting Requirements  
Each school shall post the district's policies and regulations on nutrition and physical activity in 
public view within all school cafeterias or in other central eating areas. (Education Code 49432)  

Each school shall also post a summary of nutrition and physical activity laws and regulations 
prepared by the California Department of Education.  

 

http://gamutonline.net/displayPolicy/189881/5
http://www.gamutonline.net/displayPolicy/249312/5
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Legal Reference: 

EDUCATION CODE 

33350-33354 CDE responsibilities re: physical education 

38086 Free fresh drinking water 

49430-49434 Pupil Nutrition, Health, and Achievement Act of 2001 

49490-49494 School breakfast and lunch programs 

49500-49505 School meals 

49510-49520 Nutrition 

49530-49536 Child Nutrition Act 

49540-49546 Child care food program 

49547-49548.3 Comprehensive nutrition services 

49550-49562 Meals for needy students 

49565-49565.8 California Fresh Start pilot program 

49570 National School Lunch Act 

51210 Course of study, grades 1-6 

51210.1-51210.2 Physical education, grades 1-6 

51210.4 Nutrition education 

51220 Course of study, grades 7-12 

51222 Physical education 

51223 Physical education, elementary schools 

51795-51798 School instructional gardens 

51880-51921 Comprehensive health education 

CODE OF REGULATIONS, TITLE 5 

15500-15501 Food sales by student organizations 

15510 Mandatory meals for needy students 

15530-15535 Nutrition education 

15550-15565 School lunch and breakfast programs 

UNITED STATES CODE, TITLE 42 

1751-1769j National School Lunch Program, especially: 

1758b Local wellness policy 

1771-1793 Child Nutrition Act, especially: 

1773 School Breakfast Program 

1779 Rules and regulations, Child Nutrition Act 

CODE OF FEDERAL REGULATIONS, TITLE 7 

210.1-210.33 National School Lunch Program, especially: 

210.30 Wellness policy 

220.1-220.22 National School Breakfast Program 

COURT DECISIONS 

Frazer v. Dixon Unified School District, (1993) 18 Cal.App.4th 781 

Management Resources: 

CSBA PUBLICATIONS 

Integrating Physical Activity into the School Day, Governance Brief, April 2016 

Increasing Access to Drinking Water in Schools, Policy Brief, April 2013 

Monitoring for Success: A Guide for Assessing and Strengthening Student Wellness Policies, rev. 

2012 

Nutrition Standards for Schools: Implications for Student Wellness, Policy Brief, rev. April 2012 

http://gamutonline.net/displayPolicy/131287/5
http://gamutonline.net/displayPolicy/226508/5
http://gamutonline.net/displayPolicy/658655/5
http://gamutonline.net/displayPolicy/249308/5
http://gamutonline.net/displayPolicy/249388/5
http://gamutonline.net/displayPolicy/132380/5
http://gamutonline.net/displayPolicy/222155/5
http://gamutonline.net/displayPolicy/137513/5
http://gamutonline.net/displayPolicy/132387/5
http://gamutonline.net/displayPolicy/132388/5
http://gamutonline.net/displayPolicy/132395/5
http://gamutonline.net/displayPolicy/132396/5
http://gamutonline.net/displayPolicy/899521/5
http://gamutonline.net/displayPolicy/132401/5
http://gamutonline.net/displayPolicy/132407/5
http://gamutonline.net/displayPolicy/132408/5
http://gamutonline.net/displayPolicy/132410/5
http://gamutonline.net/displayPolicy/132411/5
http://gamutonline.net/displayPolicy/512558/5
http://gamutonline.net/displayPolicy/387702/5
http://gamutonline.net/displayPolicy/387710/5
http://gamutonline.net/displayPolicy/132418/5
http://gamutonline.net/displayPolicy/132664/5
http://gamutonline.net/displayPolicy/288496/5
http://gamutonline.net/displayPolicy/288495/5
http://gamutonline.net/displayPolicy/288712/5
http://gamutonline.net/displayPolicy/132666/5
http://gamutonline.net/displayPolicy/132671/5
http://gamutonline.net/displayPolicy/132672/5
http://gamutonline.net/displayPolicy/210172/5
http://gamutonline.net/displayPolicy/807555/5
http://gamutonline.net/displayPolicy/132800/5
http://gamutonline.net/displayPolicy/132815/5
http://gamutonline.net/displayPolicy/187447/5
http://gamutonline.net/displayPolicy/187448/5
http://gamutonline.net/displayPolicy/187449/5
http://gamutonline.net/displayPolicy/187450/5
http://gamutonline.net/displayPolicy/187455/5
http://gamutonline.net/displayPolicy/187456/5
http://gamutonline.net/displayPolicy/187471/5
http://gamutonline.net/displayPolicy/191968/5
http://gamutonline.net/displayPolicy/685415/5
http://gamutonline.net/displayPolicy/685413/5
http://gamutonline.net/displayPolicy/191991/5
http://gamutonline.net/displayPolicy/191993/5
http://gamutonline.net/displayPolicy/191999/5
http://gamutonline.net/displayPolicy/189852/5
http://gamutonline.net/displayPolicy/189881/5
http://gamutonline.net/displayPolicy/189887/5
http://gamutonline.net/displayPolicy/634240/5
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Student Wellness: A Healthy Food and Physical Activity Policy Resource Guide, rev. 2012 

Physical Activity and Physical Education in California Schools, Research Brief, April 2010 

Building Healthy Communities: A School Leader's Guide to Collaboration and Community 

Engagement, 2009 

Safe Routes to School: Program and Policy Strategies for School Districts, Policy Brief, 2009 

Physical Education and California Schools, Policy Brief, rev. October 2007 

School-Based Marketing of Foods and Beverages: Policy Implications for School Boards, Policy 

Brief, March 2006 

CALIFORNIA DEPARTMENT OF EDUCATION PUBLICATIONS 

Physical Education Framework for California Public Schools, Kindergarten Through Grade 

Twelve, 2009 

Health Framework for California Public Schools, Kindergarten Through Grade Twelve, 2003 

CALIFORNIA PROJECT LEAN PUBLICATIONS 

Policy in Action: A Guide to Implementing Your Local School Wellness Policy, October 2006 

CENTER FOR COLLABORATIVE SOLUTIONS 

Changing Lives, Saving Lives: A Step-by-Step Guide to Developing Exemplary Practices in 

Healthy Eating, Physical Activity and Food Security in Afterschool Programs, January 2015 

CENTERS FOR DISEASE CONTROL AND PREVENTION PUBLICATIONS 

School Health Index for Physical Activity and Healthy Eating: A Self-Assessment and Planning 

Guide, rev. 2012 

FEDERAL REGISTER 

Rules and Regulations, July 29, 2016, Vol. 81, Number 146, pages 50151-50170 

NATIONAL ASSOCIATION OF STATE BOARDS OF EDUCATION PUBLICATIONS 

Fit, Healthy and Ready to Learn, rev. 2012 

U.S. DEPARTMENT OF AGRICULTURE PUBLICATIONS 

Dietary Guidelines for Americans, 2016 

WEB SITES 

CSBA: http://www.csba.org 

Action for Healthy Kids: http://www.actionforhealthykids.org 

Alliance for a Healthier Generation: http://www.healthiergeneration.org 

California Department of Education, Nutrition Services Division: http://www.cde.ca.gov/ls/nu 

California Department of Public Health: http://www.cdph.ca.gov 

California Healthy Kids Resource Center: http://www.californiahealthykids.org 

California Project LEAN (Leaders Encouraging Activity and Nutrition): 

http://www.californiaprojectlean.org 

California School Nutrition Association: http://www.calsna.org 

Center for Collaborative Solutions: http://www.ccscenter.org 

Centers for Disease Control and Prevention: http://www.cdc.gov 

Dairy Council of California: http://www.dairycouncilofca.org 

National Alliance for Nutrition and Activity: http://www.cspinet.org/nutritionpolicy/nana.html 

National Association of State Boards of Education: http://www.nasbe.org 

School Nutrition Association: http://www.schoolnutrition.org 

Society for Nutrition Education: http://www.sne.org 

U.S. Department of Agriculture, Food Nutrition Service, wellness policy: 

http://www.fns.usda.gov/tn/Healthy/wellnesspolicy.html 

U.S. Department of Agriculture, Healthy Meals Resource System: http://healthymeals.fns.usda.gov 

http://www.csba.org/
http://www.actionforhealthykids.org/
http://www.healthiergeneration.org/
http://www.cde.ca.gov/ls/nu
http://www.cdph.ca.gov/
http://www.californiahealthykids.org/
http://www.californiaprojectlean.org/
http://www.calsna.org/
http://www.ccscenter.org/
http://www.cdc.gov/
http://www.dairycouncilofca.org/
http://www.cspinet.org/nutritionpolicy/nana.html
http://www.nasbe.org/
http://www.schoolnutrition.org/
http://www.sne.org/
http://www.fns.usda.gov/tn/Healthy/wellnesspolicy.html
http://healthymeals.fns.usda.gov/
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